
From: Devkota, Om
To: Azu, Laud; Kono, Michiko
Cc: Hendrix, Cary; Gering, Charles; Oppenheimer, Andrew; R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk
Subject: RE: Proof of Payment : Docket No. CAA-04-2021-0201(b)
Date: Friday, July 2, 2021 1:02:14 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Dear Azu,
 
Thank you for the information. This email confirms the receipt of the payment information. The case is formally closed. Please let me know if you
have any additional questions.
 
Regards,
 
Om P. Devkota
US EPA Region 4
404-562-8963
 

From: Azu, Laud <laud.azu@ferrarausa.com> 
Sent: Friday, July 2, 2021 10:05 AM
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>; Devkota, Om <devkota.om@epa.gov>
Cc: Hendrix, Cary <cary.hendrix@ferrarausa.com>; Gering, Charles <cgering@pedersenhoupt.com>; Oppenheimer, Andrew
<andrew.oppenheimer@ferrarausa.com>
Subject: Proof of Payment : Docket No. CAA-04-2021-0201(b)
 
Dear Om,
 
The Ferrara Candy Company in fulfillment of the above reference docket for the Florence, KY plant has made the payment below as directed by
the EPA. Please let us know if you have any questions. Thank you
 

 
 
Regards,
 
Laud Azu
Environmental, Health and Safety Manager-Cookies
500 Weaver Road
Florence, KY 41042
C: 773-963-2878
Laud.azu@ferrarausa.com
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